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1 message

dany santoso <danysantoso@unesa.ac.id>

Prof. Dr. H. Hadiyanto <hadiyanto@live.undip.ac.id> Sun, Dec 8, 2019 at 8:20 AM

To: Dany Iman Santoso <danysantoso@unesa.ac.id>
Dany Iman Santoso:

Thank you for submitting the manuscript, "Optimizing solar dish performance
using analytical flux distribution in focal region" to International Journal

of Renewable Energy Development. With the online journal management system
that we are using, you will be able to track its progress through the

editorial process by logging in to the journal web site:

Manuscript URL:
https://ejournal.undip.ac.id/index.php/ijred/author/submission/27111
Username: dany_santoso

Please note that the International Journal of Renewable Energy Development
is now indexed by Scopus database, therefore, we would maintain the quality
of accepted paper high.

If you have any questions, please contact me. Thank you for considering this
journal as a venue for your work.

Prof. Dr. H. Hadiyanto
International Journal of Renewable Energy Development

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=75464489fb&view=pt&search=all&permthid=thread-f%3A1652312566807280995&simpl=msg-f%3A1652312...
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dany santoso <danysantoso@unesa.ac.id>

[[JRED] Editor Decision

1 message

Prof. Dr H Hadiyanto <hadiyanto@live.undip.ac.id> Sun, Dec 8, 2019 at 8:46 AM
To: Dany Iman Santoso <danysantoso@unesa.ac.id>

Dear Dany Iman Santoso:

| am writing regarding your manuscript entitled :"Optimizing solar dish
performance using analytical flux distribution in focal region" which you
submitted to the to International Journal of Renewable Energy Development.

Based on the Reviewer feedback as well as my own reading of your manuscript
| want to strongly encourage you to undertake revisions and then resubmit

your manuscript for consideration for publication in the International

Journal of Renewable Energy Development.

| hope that this feedback will be helpful to you in developing your

research, and that you will be encouraged to undertake the revisions within
the next few weeks. You should know that manuscripts normally are revised at
least once before being accepted for publication in the International

Journal of Renewable Energy Development. Please don’t hesitate to contact
me if you have any questions about the comments above.

To submit a revision, go to http://ejournal.undip.ac.id/index.php/ijred and
log in. You will be able to upload the revision and detailed response to
reviewer comments.

When you submit a revised version of your paper, please include a statement
explaining how this version reflects the feedback received from the
Reviewers and the editors. Also, note if, and explain why, you decided not

to follow any points made by Reviewers or editors.

When we receive your revised manuscript, we will send it to at least some of
the previous Reviewers and ask them to assess whether you have addressed the
main issues and, thus, whether your work should be accepted for publication.

Finally, we would appreciate it if you would acknowledge receipt of this
message and, as soon as possible, let us know a) whether you plan to rewrite
your paper as well as b) when you would plan to submit a new version to the
International Journal of Renewable Energy Development for review.

Prof. Dr H Hadiyanto
Center of Biomass and Renewable Energy (CBIORE), Diponegoro University
hadiyanto@live.undip.ac.id

Reviewer A

Abstract is too short and must give main quantitative result data and final
conclusion. The abstract must be written in past tenses.

Please also confirm that all equation in 1-9 were calculated and show the
result in the papers

The citation and references did not follow the guidelines.

Provide more references
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1 message

Hadiyanto <hadiyanto@live.undip.ac.id> Fri, Dec 27, 2019 at 6:52 PM
To: Dany Iman Santoso <danysantoso@unesa.ac.id>

Although the revision has been made, however, some error still appear:
1. The citation are not following the guidelines
2. Please check for some typo for example Temperatur must be replaced by Temperature

3. We coonsider for acceptance however the manuscript must be thorugh proof read. Please do proof read because a lot of
grammatical error and English issue in the documents

Send also the proof of English check

On Mon, Dec 16, 2019 at 2:23 PM Dany Iman Santoso <danysantoso@unesa.ac.id> wrote:
H Hadiyanto:

A revised version of "Optimizing solar dish performance using analytical
flux distribution in focal region" has been uploaded by the author Dany Iman
Santoso.

Submission URL:
https://ejournal.undip.ac.id/index.php/ijred/editor/submissionReview/27111

Prof. Dr. H. Hadiyanto
International Journal of Renewable Energy Development
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Re: [IURED] Revised Version Uploaded

1 message

Hadiyanto <hadiyanto@live.undip.ac.id> Tue, Jan 7, 2020 at 1:19 PM
To: Dany Iman Santoso <danysantoso@unesa.ac.id>

Dear Author

As we suggested in previous review process, the manuscript needs to be checked by English native speaker.
Please send the proof of this check before its acceptance

The current version has a lot of many error in spelling anmd grammar

Editor

On Tue, Jan 7, 2020 at 12:53 PM Dany Iman Santoso <danysantoso@unesa.ac.id> wrote:
H Hadiyanto:

A revised version of "Optimizing solar dish performance using analytical
flux distribution in focal region" has been uploaded by the author Dany Iman
Santoso.

Submission URL:
https://ejournal.undip.ac.id/index.php/ijred/editor/submissionReview/27 111

Prof. Dr. H. Hadiyanto
International Journal of Renewable Energy Development
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1 message

dany santoso <danysantoso@unesa.ac.id>

Prof. Dr H Hadiyanto <hadiyanto@live.undip.ac.id> Sun, Jan 19, 2020 at 2:47 PM

To: Dany Iman Santoso <danysantoso@unesa.ac.id>
Dear Dany Iman Santoso

Your manuscript submitted to International Journal of Renewable Energy
Development, entitled "Optimizing solar dish performance using analytical
flux distribution in focal region" has been subjected to review process by
IJRED reviewers who are experts in the related fields.

Based on the reviewers' recommendations, | am delighted to inform you that
your manuscript has been ACCEPTED for the International Journal of Renewable
Energy Development.

We will proceed your manuscript to layout editor and send the proof to you
for final correction. Please note that there will be no more revision
allowed after this stage is reached.

Thank you very much for submitting your article to the International Journal
of Renewable Energy Development. | look forward to receiving the revised
version of your manuscript.

Sincerely,

Prof. Dr H Hadiyanto

Center of Biomass and Renewable Energy (CBIORE), Diponegoro University
hadiyanto@live.undip.ac.id
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7 messages

dany santoso <danysantoso@unesa.ac.id>

Hadiyanto <hadiyanto@live.undip.ac.id> Sat, Feb 1, 2020 at 8:35 PM

To: Dany Iman Santoso <danysantoso@unesa.ac.id>
Dear Dr Santoso
Thank you for your email. Please find your article proof and this will be published in February issue.
The proof must be read carefully and returned with an y revision or changes, and will be no more changes after this

stage.

Please also pay the APC of 150 US and transferred to the bank account or paypal

Acc. Holder : Hadiyanto(C-BIORE )

Acc. Nr : 135-00-0705294-5

Bank Name : Bank Mandiri

Bank Branch : Bank Mandiri Srondol

Address : JI. Setiabudi No. G 62 E & F Semarang
Swiftcode : BMRIIDJA854

Or through paypal account: hadiyanto.undip@gmail.com
Please return the proof as soon as possible

Editor

ﬂ Santoso et al .pdf
686K

dany santoso <danysantoso@unesa.ac.id> Sat, Feb 1, 2020 at 10:01 PM

To: Hadiyanto <hadiyanto@live.undip.ac.id>
Dear Editor,
Approved, please proceed.
Best regards,

Authors
[Quoted text hidden]

Hadiyanto <hadiyanto@live.undip.ac.id> Sat, Feb 1, 2020 at 10:07 PM

To: dany santoso <danysantoso@unesa.ac.id>

Please send the proof of payment
[Quoted text hidden]

dany santoso <danysantoso@unesa.ac.id> Mon, Feb 3, 2020 at 8:41 AM

To: Hadiyanto <hadiyanto@live.undip.ac.id>
Dear Prof. Hadiyanto,

| would send the APC at Bank Mandiri but the teller said that there is a Rupiah Account regarding your Mandiri
account.

Should you send your Dollar Account or | have to send Rupiah to your Mandiri Account?
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Best regards,
Dany Iman Santoso
[Quoted text hidden]

Hadiyanto <hadiyanto@live.undip.ac.id> Mon, Feb 3, 2020 at 9:29 AM
To: dany santoso <danysantoso@unesa.ac.id>

Yes..it is equivalent for Rp. 2.050.000

Thank you
[Quoted text hidden]

dany santoso <danysantoso@unesa.ac.id> Mon, Feb 3, 2020 at 9:36 AM
To: Hadiyanto <hadiyanto@live.undip.ac.id>

| have paid and this is the proof.
Thank you

Regards,
Dany
[Quoted text hidden]
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Hadiyanto <hadiyanto@live.undip.ac.id> Mon, Feb 3, 2020 at 9:44 AM
To: dany santoso <danysantoso@unesa.ac.id>

Dear Dr Santoso
thank you..however you must revised your proof.

1. Provide the affiliation detail, incl department.
2. Provide year of citation indicated by yellow highlight

Some english need improvements
[Quoted text hidden]
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